
 

 

RUVB2 rabbit pAb

Catalog No :   YT7373

Reactivity :   Human;Mouse

Applications :   WB

Target :   RUVB2

Gene Name :   RUVBL2 INO80J TIP48 TIP49B CGI-46

Protein Name :   RUVB2

Human Gene Id :   10856

Human Swiss Prot
No : 

  Q9Y230

Mouse Gene Id :   20174

Mouse Swiss Prot
No : 

  Q9WTM5

Immunogen :   Synthesized peptide derived from human RUVB2 AA range: 7-57

Specificity :   This antibody detects endogenous levels of RUVB2 at Human/Mouse

Formulation :   Liquid in PBS containing 50% glycerol, 0.5% BSA and 0.02% sodium azide.

Source :   Polyclonal, Rabbit,IgG

Dilution :   WB 1：500-2000

Purification :   The antibody was affinity-purified from rabbit antiserum by affinity-
chromatography using epitope-specific immunogen.

Concentration :   1 mg/ml

Storage Stability :   -15°C to -25°C/1 year(Do not lower than -25°C)

                               1 / 3



 

Molecularweight :   51kD

Background :   This gene encodes the second human homologue of the bacterial RuvB gene.
Bacterial RuvB protein is a DNA helicase essential for homologous recombination
and DNA double-strand break repair. Functional analysis showed that this gene
product has both ATPase and DNA helicase activities. This gene is physically
linked to the CGB/LHB gene cluster on chromosome 19q13.3, and is very close
(55 nt) to the LHB gene, in the opposite orientation. [provided by RefSeq, Jul
2008],

Function :   domain:The C-terminal domain is required for association with
ATF2.,function:Possesses single-stranded DNA-stimulated ATPase and ATP-
dependent DNA helicase (5' to 3') activity. Component of the NuA4 histone
acetyltransferase complex which is involved in transcriptional activation of select
genes principally by acetylation of nucleosomal histones H4 and H2A. This
modification may both alter nucleosome - DNA interactions and promote
interaction of the modified histones with other proteins which positively regulate
transcription. This complex may be required for the activation of transcriptional
programs associated with oncogene and proto-oncogene mediated growth
induction, tumor suppressor mediated growth arrest and replicative senescence,
apoptosis, and DNA repair. The NuA4 complex ATPase and helicase activities
seem to be, at least in part, contributed by the association of RUVBL1 and RU

Subcellular
Location : 

  Nucleus matrix. Nucleus, nucleoplasm. Cytoplasm. Membrane. Dynein
axonemal particle . Mainly localized in the nucleus, associated with nuclear matrix
or in the nuclear cytosol. Although it is also present in the cytoplasm and
associated with the cell membranes.

Expression :   Ubiquitously expressed. Highly expressed in testis and thymus. 

Sort :   14661

No4 :   1

Host :   Rabbit

Modifications :   Unmodified

 Products Images 
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Western blot analysis of lysates from THP-1 cells, primary
antibody was diluted at 1:1000, 4°over night
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